
Court No. - 16

Case :- HABEAS CORPUS WRIT PETITION No. - 131 of 
2024

Petitioner :- Mr. Beeru Thru. His Mother Veena Devi
Respondent :- State Of U.P. Thru. Prin. Secy. Deptt. Of Home 
Lko And 5 Others
Counsel for Petitioner :- Ashish Kumar Singh,Harsh Kumar 
Singh,Shakeel Qureshi
Counsel for Respondent :- G.A.

Hon'ble Mohd. Faiz Alam Khan,J.

1. Heard.

2. Learned AGA states that instructions have been furnished by
the police station Huzoorpur, district Bahraich.

3. The aforesaid instructions have been produced for perusal of
this court and the same are taken on record.

4.  Perusal  of  the  aforesaid  instructions  would  reveal  that  in
pursuance of  the information given by Shri Amarjeet,  son of
Shri  Kailash,  resident  of  Village  Machhiya,  Police  Station
Huzoorpur,  District  Bahraich  a  missing  report  has  been
registered at police station Chandni Bagh, Panipat, Haryana and
efforts  are  being  made  to  trace  the  missing  person/alleged
detenue. 

5. Learned counsel for the petitioner, at this juncture, submits
that the petitioner is the mother of the detenue and she is not in
a position to herself undertake efforts to trace her son.

6.  Having  heard  learned  counsel  for  the  parties  and  having
perused  the  instructions  obtained  by  the  learned  AGA,  the
Station  House  Officer,  Chandni  Bagh,  Panipat,  Haryana  is
directed to make all-out  efforts  to trace the missing detenue,
namely,  Beeru,  aged  about  13  years,  son  of  Shri  Bechan,
permanent  resident  of  Machhiya  Sutaouli,  Police  Station
Huzoorpur,  Tehsil  Kaiserganj,  District  Bahraich,  who  was
residing at  Sector-12,  in front of  Mother Teressa,  Bunalow
No.9, Chandni Bagh, Panipat, Haryana  and submit a report to
this court annexing therewith the documentary proof of all the
efforts  which have  been undertaken for  tracing/searching the
detenue. 

7. Let a copy of this order be immediately transmitted to the
D.G.P., Haryana for compliance through the Senior Registrar of



this Court.

8. List this petition on 14.06.2024 to be taken up at 2.15 p.m.

Order Date :- 21.5.2024
MVS/- 
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